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Abstract:  
 
Treatment for cardiovascular disease (CVD) has become complex over the past few decades in 
large part because of extensive clinical research emerging from the field. Moreover, technology 
has created an explosion of information readily at our fingertips. However, sorting through the 
vast amount of data is difficult for an individual nurse practitioner (NP) in a busy clinical 
practice. 
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Article:  
 
Treatment for cardiovascular disease (CVD) has become complex over the past few decades in 
large part because of extensive clinical research emerging from the field. Moreover, technology 
has created an explosion of information readily at our fingertips. However, sorting through the 
vast amount of data is difficult for an individual nurse practitioner (NP) in a busy clinical 
practice. 
 
Traditionally, NPs have used experience, observation, and guidance from authoritative sources to 
make treatment decisions for individual patients. Instead, NPs should augment their clinical 
decision making with guideline-directed medical therapy (GDMT). GDMT stems from the push 
for clinicians to use evidence-based practice, the deliberate use of the best scientific evidence 
from population research, combined with clinical expertise and patient preferences to make care 
decisions.1 
 
GDMT clinical guidelines provide one type of evidence and synthesize a large amount of 
evidence-based data to offer recommendations for the busy NP. Advantages of these guidelines 
are that they are based on large population studies, take into consideration the variability in 
patients and disease trajectory, are periodically updated as new research becomes available, and 
are readily available online or in journals in the public domain. Furthermore, these guidelines 
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offer a ranking system to designate the level of evidence used to support various 
recommendations and to determine their strength in terms of risk-benefit for patients. 
 
However, clinical guidelines are not a mandate for treating individual patients. NPs should 
examine each clinical situation closely and make sure the recommendations from the guideline 
match the patient being treated (ie, ensure that the patient is on the same background therapy that 
is suggested before moving to the next level of care). Thus, it is best for NPs to combine their 
knowledge of the guidelines with knowledge of their individual patients. 
 
This special issue offers readers a translation of current CV guidelines and selected research on 
each topic for NP practice and education. Topics were selected based on recently published or 
pending guidelines or those experiencing a paradigm shift in treatment. NP authors were invited 
based on their relevant clinical expertise, and they reviewed changes in the latest clinical 
guidelines to emphasize implications for NP practice. Given space limitations, each article is not 
intended to be a comprehensive overview but rather a brief discussion. Our hope is that readers 
will get an update to improve the care of their patients at risk or with CVD. 
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